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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR THE PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND 
CONSULTANCY SERVICES AND FOR ENGINEERING PROJECTS

(PMO-PALAWAN-BAC)

Resolution No. U 
Series of 2019

DECLARING THE BID OF EMCOR, INC FOR ITEM NOS. 5, 6, 7, 8 & 10 AS THE LOWEST 
CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID AND RECOMMENDING TO THE ACTING PORT 
MANAGER THE AWARD OF THE CONTRACT;

AND DECLARING FAILURE OF BIDDING FOR ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 4 & 9 AND 
RECOMMENDING TOTHE ACTING PORT MANAGER TO CONDUCT RE-BIDDING;

WHEREAS, the Philippine Ports Authority, PMO Palawan posted the Invitation to Bid for 

the Procurement of Various Furniture, Fixtures and Equipment Under the Annual Equipment 

Procurement Program (AEPP) for CY 2019 in the PhilGEPS and PPA websites, and at BAG 

Bulletin Board of PMO- Palawan continuously for Seven (7) days from August 20- 26, 2019;

WHEREAS, in response to our postings/ invitations, three (3) suppliers responded 

namely;

1. Emcor, Inc.

2. Asahi Design Center Inc

3. LJM Fire Protection Services and Trading

WHEREAS, before the scheduled time of submission of bids on September 09, 2019, 

these three (3) suppliers submitted their bids in sealed envelope. Emcor, Inc submitted its bid 

and was received by the BAG on September 09, 2019 at 7:15 A.M, while Asahi Design Center 

Inc. on September 09, 2019 at 7:21 A.M and LJM Fire Protection Services and Trading was 

received on September 09, 2019 at 7:42 A.M, respectively.

WHEREAS, on the scheduled opening of bids on September 10, 2019 at 9:00 A.M., the 

Bids and Awards Committee opened and evaluated the bid documents of the aforenamed 

suppliers and unanimously agreed and declared that the two (2) suppliers, namely Emcor, Inc 

and Asahi Design Center Inc met and complied with the requirements.

WHEREAS, the BAC unanimously agreed and declared that the Technical Bid of LJM 

Fire Protection Services and Trading failed to comply with the requirements. The Financial Bid 

was not opened.

WHEREAS, the BAC Vice-Chairperson read the financial bids of Emcor, Inc and Asahi 

Design Center Inc, all bid prices are exclusive of VAT as follows:



Quantity
Item/Description

Approved 
Budget for the 
Contract (Total 

Amount)

EMCOR, INC ASAHI DESIGN 
CENTER INC

Furniture & Fixture

1 1
Senior Citizen/PWD/ 
Pregnant Women Area- 
Designated Area

-P 30,000.00 NO BID P 30,000.00

2 1 Diaper Changing Station 
Table

20,000.00 NO BID 10,000.00

3 1 Breastfeeding Station
Chair

25,000.00 NO BID 25,000.00

Office Equipment

4 1 lot Fire Alarm System 4,000,000.00 NO BID 3,750,000.00

5 6 Airconditioner, Window 
Type, 2 HP, Inverter

360,000.00 P 311,520.00 360,000.00

6 10
Airconditioner, Window 
Type, 1 HP, Inverter

350,000.00 300,960.00 345,000.00

7 10 Airconditioner, Package 
Type, 3T with installation

1,600,000.00 1,297,780.00 1,580,000.00

8 3 Airconditioner, Window 
Type, 1.5 HP, Inverter

150,000.00 129,360.00 150,000.00

9 1 Digital DSLR Camera 50,000.00 NO BID 49,280.00

10 3 Television Set, Smart TV, 
40”

99,000.00 83,160.00 97,440.00

TOTAL P 6,684,000.00 P 2,122,780.00 P 6,396,720.00

WHEREAS, the BAC-TWG conducted detailed evaluation of bid per item on September 

10, 2019. On their report submitted to the BAG on September 10, 2019, the BAC-TWG 

recommended that the submitted bid of Emcor, Inc. for Item Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8 & 10 be declared as 

the Lowest Calculated Bid and be subjected to post-qualification.

WHEREAS, The BAC- TWG, upon careful examination and detailed evaluation of the 

technical bid, declared Asahi Design Center Inc disqualified.

WHEREAS, on September 13, 2019 the BAC-TWG conducted post-qualification on the 

eligibility and technical documents as well as financial proposal of Emcor, Inc. Based on the 

results as presented in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Report, Emcor, Inc was declared as 

the Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid for Items Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8 & 10 and recommended the 

award of bid.

r



NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee for the 

Procurement of Goods and Consultancy Services and for Engineering Projects (PMO- 

PALAWAN-BAC), hereby RESOLVE as it is hereby RESOLVED:

1. To declare the bid of Emcor, Inc. as the Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid for Items 

Nos. 5, 6, 7, 8 & 10 amounting to Two Million One Hundred Twenty- Two Thousand 

Seven Hundred Eighty pesos (R 2,122,780.00) for the Procurement of Various Furniture, 

Fixtures and Equipment Under Annual Equipment Procurement Program (AEPP) for CY 

2019 and to recommend to the Acting Port Manager the award of the contract.

2. To declare a failure of bidding for Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4 & 9 as stated below with the 

approved budget of Four Million One Hundred Twenty- Five Thousand pesos 

(P 4,125,000.00) and to recommend to Acting Port Manager of PMO-Palawan, as the 

Head of Procuring Entity, to conduct a re-bidding with re-advertisement and/or posting of 

the subject project, as provided for in RA 9184 and its 2016 Revised IRR.

3. To recommend the approval of the foregoing findings by the Acting Port Manager.

RESOLVED at the PMO Conference Room, PPA PMO-Palawan Administrative Building, 

Puerto Princesa City, this 13th day of September 2019.

NEL . CAABAY, JR
-Chairperson

(Absent)
ERWIN S. GATPANDAN

Chairperson

GUZMAN
Member

MARITES C. COHEN
Member

(on official travel)
ALLAN S. MANUEL

Member

APPROVED:

ELIZALDE M. ULSON
Acting Port Manager


