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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR THE PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND
CONSULTANCY SERVICES AND FOR ENGINEERING PROJECTS
(PMO-PALAWAN-BAC)

RESOLUTION No. 23-2018

DECLARING THE BID OF LILY HILL TRADING FOR ITEM NOS. 1, 3,4,5,6,7,9, 10 & 11
AS THELOWESTCALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID AND RECOMMENDING TO THE
PORT MANAGER THE AWARD OF THE CONTRACT;

DECLARING THE BID OF LJM INDUSTRIAL SAFETY PRODUCTS FOR ITEM NO. 8 AS
THELOWESTCALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID AND RECOMMENDING TO THE PORT
MANAGER THE AWARD OF THE CONTRACT;

AND DECLARING FAILURE OF BIDDING FOR ITEM NOS. 2 & 12 AND RECOMMENDING
TOTHE PORT MANAGER THE CONDUCT OF SMALL VALUE PROCUREMENT.

WHEREAS, the Philippine Ports Authority, PMO Palawan posted the Invitation to Bid for
the Procurement of Various Furniture, Fixtures and Equipment Under the Annual Equipment
Procurement Program (AEPP) for 2018 in the PhilGEPS and PPA websites, and at BAC Bulletin
Board of PMO- Palawan continuously for fourteen (14) days from November 21- December 04,
2018;

WHEREAS, in response to our postings/ invitations, two (2) suppliers responded
namely;

1. Lily Hill Trading

2. LJM industrial Safety Products

WHEREAS, before the scheduled time of submission of bids on December 04, 2018,
these two (2) suppliers submitted their bids in sealed envelope. Lily Hill Trading submitted its bid
and was received by the BAC on December 4, 2018 at 8:26 A.M while LUM Industrial Safety
Product was received on December 4, 2018 at 8:25 AM;

WHEREAS, on the scheduled opening of bid on December 04, 2018 at 9:30 A.M., the
BAC opened and evaluated the bid documents of the afore-named suppliers, and unanimously
agreed and declared that the two (2) suppliers met and complied with the requirements;

WHEREAS, the BAC Chairperson read the financial bids, all bid prices are exclusive of
VAT as follows:

ltem Item/Description ABC Lily Hill LJMS:?e :lstnal
Trading y
No. Products
1 DINING TABLE ( 6 Seaters) P25,000.00 | PR20,982.14 NO BID
2 VAULT, cash and record vault, steel, 78.000.00 NO BID NO BID
fire proof




NO BID

3 igtl;ﬁ; rsei'er) (3-1-1 with center table, 45,000.00 38,392.86

4 | STEEL LATERAL CABINET, 4 drawers | 80.000.00 | 51,785.71 NO BID

5 | CONFERENCE TABLE, with chairs 173,000.00 | 14752149 NOBID

6 ;I:;CONDITIONER, Window Type, 360,000.00 | 318,750.00 NOBID

7 | FAX MACHINE 35,000.00 | 10,267.86 NO BID

8 | FIRE ALARM SYSTEM 350,000.00 | 154,375.00 | P 30357143

9 | REFRIGERATOR 30,000.00 | 18,303.57 NO BID

10 | TELEVISION SET, 40", LCDFlat TV, | 105,000.00 | 71,919.64 NO BID

Cable ready

11 | ELECTRONIC TYPEWRITER 30,000.00 |  26,290.18 NO BID
P 66,964.29

12 | INTERCOM SYSTEM 150,000.00 | NOBID “;{;i;‘;’f

point only)

WHEREAS, the BAC-TWG conducted detailed evaluation of bid per item on December
04, 2018. On their report submitted to the BAC on December 04, 2018, the BAC-TWG
recommended that the submitted bid of Lily Hill Trading for ltem Nos. 1, 3, 4,5,6,7, 9, 10 & 11
and the submitted bid of LUM Industrial Safety Products for Item No. 8 be declared as the
Lowest Calculated Bid and be subjected to post-qualification;

WHEREAS, on December 5, 2018 the BAC-TWG conducted post-qualification on the
eligibility and technical documents as well as financial proposal of Lily Hill Trading and LJM
Industrial Safety Products. Based on the results as presented in the Post-Qualification
Evaluation Report, Lily Hill Trading was declared as the Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid for
ltems Nos. 1, 3,4, 5,6,7,9, 10 & 11 and LJM Industrial Safety Products for Item No. 8 and
recommended the award of bid.

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee for the
Procurement of Goods and Consultancy Services and for Engineering Projects (PMO-
PALAWAN-BAC), hereby RESOLVE as it is hereby RESOLVED:

1. To declare the bid of Lily Hill Trading as the Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid for items
Nos. 1, 3,4, 5,6, 7,9, 10 & 11 for the Procurement of Various Furniture, Fixtures and
Equipment Under Annual Equipment Procurement Program (AEPP) for CY 2018 and to
recommend to the Port Manager the award of the contract.

2. To declare the bid of LJM Industrial Safety Products as the Lowest Calculated
Responsive Bid for items No. 8 for the Procurement of Various Furniture, Fixtures and
Equipment Under Annual Equipment Procurement Program (AEPP) for CY 2018 and to
recommend to the Port Manager the award of the contract.




3. To declare a failure of bidding for Iltem nos. 2 & 12 as stated below with the approved
budget of Two Hundred Twenty Eight Thousand Pesos (228,000.00) and to recommend
to the Port Manager the conduct Small Value Procurement pursuant to Section 53.9 of
R.A. 9184 and its Revised 2016 IRR.

4. To recommend the approval of the foregoing findings by the Port Manager.

RESOLVED at the PMO Conference Room, PPA PMO-Palawan Administrative Building,
Puerto Princesa City, this 6th day of December 2018.

Chairperson <
(ON- TRAVEL) LQ(

NELSON Y. CAABAY, JR J EL ELLIDO

Vice-Chairperson Member

Mok &<
MARITES C. COHEN FRASY M. DE GUZMAN

Member Member

APPROVED :

s
ELVIg R. MEDALLA

Port Manager



